

**Bid Tabulation Sheets - Leelanau Co. Road Commission
Opened and read on March 17, 2017**

Emulsion bids

Vendors	MPM	Bit-Mat Products	Asphalt Materials, Inc	2015 winning bid
HFRS-2 emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.7400	\$ 2.000	\$ 1.9200	\$ 1.8903
HFRS-2M emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.9400	\$ 2.300	\$ 2.1200	\$ 2.1903
CRS-2M emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.9500	No bid	\$ 2.2200	
Fog Seal CSS-1h emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.4000	No bid	\$ 1.7200	\$ 1.4403
Fog Seal QTF emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.2900	No bid	No bid	\$ 1.5903
Alternative Quick Set Fog Seal emulsion (price per gallon)	No bid	\$ 1.500	\$ 1.770	

Brine bids (per gallon)

Vendors	Beckman Production	Taplin Group	Michigan Chloride Sales LLC	2015 winning bid
26% Calcium Chloride - spread	\$ 0.203	\$ 0.250	\$ 0.230	\$ 0.199
26% Calcium Chloride - into storage	\$ 0.183	\$ 0.250	\$ 0.220	\$ 0.179

* Great Lakes Chloride bid arrived after deadline - not considered.

Fuel bids

Vendors	Bayshore Oil Omena	Crystal Flash Traverse City	2015 winning bid
<u>Diesel-delivered into storage:</u>			
-Mar 16, 2017 current total price/gal	\$ 1.6340	\$ 1.6230	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.03	\$ 0.0957	\$ 0.04
-Terminal location	Not specified	Ferrysberg	
<u>Diesel-delivered to skid tank:</u>			
-Mar 16, 2017 current total price/gal	\$ 1.8040	\$ 1.8773	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.20
-Terminal location	Not specified	Ferrysberg	
<u>Unleaded gas-delivered storage:</u>			
-Mar 16, 2017 current total price/gal	\$ 1.5741	\$ 1.5258	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.10	\$ 0.0733	\$ 0.08
-Terminal location	Not specified	Ferrysberg	

Aggregate

Vendors	Elmers	Verplank Trucking	Fisher Transportation	Rieth-Riley
34CS Slag Delivered to SB garage	\$ 38.60	\$ 52.47	\$ 48.66	\$ 39.50
34CS Slag Delivered to MC garage	\$ 36.00	\$ 52.47	\$ 48.66	\$ 38.50
Alternative bid:				
CS2 Trap Rock Delivered to SB garage	\$ 35.70	\$ 43.47	No Bid	\$ 36.55
CS2 Trap Rock Delivered to MC garage	\$ 33.10	\$ 43.47	No Bid	\$ 35.55