

**Bid Tabulation: 2015 Annual Materials - Leelanau Co. Road Commission
Opened and read on March 3, 2015**

Emulsion bids

Vendors	Terry Asphalt Materials, Inc	Bit-Mat Products	Asphalt Materials, Inc	2013 winning bid
Item:				
HFRS-2 Emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 1.8903	\$ 1.988	\$ 1.9176	\$ 1.9176
HFRS-2M Emulsion (price per gallon)	\$ 2.1903	\$ 2.288	\$ 2.2176	\$ 2.3176
Optional bids:				
Fog seal - CSS1h	\$ 1.4403			
Fasblack	\$ 1.5903			
Chiplock Fog seal		\$ 1.438		

Brine bids (per gallon)

* Annual usage under \$25K - competitive bids not required

Vendors	Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales	Michigan Chloride Sales	Great Lakes Chloride, Inc	Beckman Production	2012 winning bid
Item:					
26% Calcium Chloride - spread	No bid	\$ 0.220	\$ 0.407	\$ 0.199	\$ 0.199
26% Calcium Chloride - into storage	No bid	\$ 0.21	\$ 0.362	\$ 0.179	\$ 0.179
38% Calcium Chloride - spread	\$ 0.64	No bid	\$ 0.501	No bid	None
38% Calcium Chloride - into storage	\$ 0.61	No bid	\$ 0.461	No bid	None

Fuel bids

Vendors	Bayshore Oil-Propane	2013 winning bid
Item:		
Diesel-delivered into storage:		
-Feb 27, 2015 current total price/gal	\$ 2.1666	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.04	\$ 0.03
-Terminal location	Muskegon	
Diesel-delivered to skid tank:		
-Feb 27, 2015 current total price/gal	\$ 2.3266	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.20
-Terminal location	Muskegon	
Unleaded gas-delivered storage:		
-Feb 27, 2015 current total price/gal	\$ 1.750	
-Price over rack	\$ 0.08	\$ 0.13